
Good afternoon.  Welcome to the City of Fort Worth public bid opening for 

Thursday, June 21, 2018.

Today, we have 1 ITB RFQuote

2 RFP’s           4 Construction bid (s) 0 RFQual

Property Bids

                             

Due to the confidential and negotiable nature of RFP’s & RFQualifications, only the names of the 
respondents will be read.



Project:

DATE: June 21, 2018

 

Company Name

1 $733,150.00

2 $608,150.00

3 $578,935.50

4 $

5 $

6 $

7 $

8 $

9 $

10 $

RS

Control Technologies Inc

 

BIDS ARE ACCEPTED UNTIL 1:30 PM Thursday, June 21, 2018

Not All Items BidITF Plus

Iteris Inc

DEPARTMENT:  TPW/Traffic Mgmt

Bid Amount

LOG SHEET

18-0311: ITB - Iteris Traffic Cameras



Project:

DEPARTMENT:  

DATE: June 21, 2018

 

Company Name

1

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

SB

Inuganti Vamsi

 

 

State Food Safety

BIDS ARE ACCEPTED UNTIL 1:30 PM Thursday, June 21, 2018

LOG SHEET

RFP 18-0288: Learning Management System - Online Food Safety
IT



Project:

DEPARTMENT:  Police/Fiscal & Equipment Mgmt

DATE: June 21, 2018

 

Company Name

1

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

JD

LOG SHEET

BIDS ARE ACCEPTED UNTIL 1:30 PM Thursday, June 21, 2018

Fort Worth Area Towing Alliance

Dispatch & Tracking Solutions

TXI Systems Inc

Tegsco LLC

Sterling Towing & Recovery

ABC Wrecker Services

UR International Inc.

RFP 18-0233: Police Initiated Towing Services



Project:

DEPARTMENT:  

DATE: June 21, 2018

 

Company Name Bid Amount Bid Bond

1 $2,913,095.00 5%

2 $2,208,428.25 100

3 $

4 $

5 $

6 $

7 $

8 $

9 $

10 $

BIDS ARE ACCEPTED UNTIL 1:30 PM Thursday, June 21, 2018

Wilma Smith

LOG SHEET

 00705: Six Points Urban Village Phase II
TPW

Fain Group

ARK Contracting Services



Project:

DEPARTMENT:  

DATE: June 21, 2018

 

Company Name

$7,634,490.00

1 A-1 No Bid

$7,006,125.00

2 A-1 No Bid

$6,727,000.00

3 A-1 No Bid

$6,862,125.00

4 A-1 No Bid

$6,824,000.00

5 A-1 $7,328,000.00

6 $

7 $

8 $

9 $

10 $

Farida Goderya

A-2 $6,437,000.00

A-2 $6,754,125.00

A-2 $6,776,000.00

Bid Amount

A-2 $7,224,405.00

A-2 $6,911,125.00

Eagle Contracting

02669: Village Creek Water Reclamation Facility Liquid Biosolids

LOG SHEET

Water

BIDS ARE ACCEPTED UNTIL 1:30 PM Thursday, June 21, 2018

Gracon Construction

Crescent Construction Co.

Archer Western Construction Co.

Felix Construction Co.



Project:

DEPARTMENT:  

DATE: June 21, 2018

 

Company Name Bid Amount

1 $

2 $

3 $

4 $

5 $

6 $

7 $

8 $

9 $

10 $

BIDS ARE ACCEPTED UNTIL 1:30 PM Thursday, June 21, 2018

Mike Bennett

00778: Lebow Channel Roadway Crossing Replacement at Brennan Avenue
TPW

LOG SHEET



Project:

DEPARTMENT:  

DATE: June 21, 2018

 

Company Name Bid Amount

1 $5,811,945.00

2 $5,706,538.00

3 $5,558,953.70

4 $4,328,155.50

5 $

6 $

7 $

8 $

9 $

10 $

BIDS ARE ACCEPTED UNTIL 1:30 PM Thursday, June 21, 2018

Thank you for your attention.

Roberto Sauceda

LOG SHEET

Water & Sewer

Circle C Construction

SJ Louis Construction

Jackson Construction

ARK Contracting Svcs

Conclusion: Ladies & Gentlemen, this concludes the City of Fort Worth’s public bid opening for 

Thursday, June 21, 2018 .

01928: Contract 2011 WSM-A Part 2


