FORT WORTH

Good afternoon. Welcome to the City of Fort Worth public bid opening for Thursday, May 14,
2020

Today, we have:

2 ITB 1 RFQual
RFP'S 3 Construction Bid(s)
RFQuote Property Bids

Due to the confidential and negotiable nature of RFP's & RFQualifications, only the names of the
respondents will be read. Bid amounts have not been verified at bid reading. Prices will be
verified during evaluations

Conclusion:

Ladies & Gentemen, this concludes the City of Fort Worth's Public bid opening for Thursday,May
14, 2020. Thank you for your attention.



FORT WORTH

Unknown Bids

Date: 5/14/2020

Unknown:

1 Mail 2

Company Name:

(Rekor Systems?)

2 Unknown #3

Aguirre & Fields

3 Unknown #4

Randall Reed's Prestige Ford

4 Unknown #5

Alltech Engineering Corp

5 Unknown #6

Ace Pipe Cleaning

Bid Number:

Addendum No. 1 (1095?)

RFQ Professional Engineering

20-0130

Pre-C02645 Qualifications

102639 2020 Misc Manhole

6 Unknown #7 Bobcat Unknown

7 Unknown #8 ARS Engineers, Inc. RFQ for Professional Engineers

8 Mail 1 JT Engineering RFQ for Professional Engineering Design
9 Unknown #9 JT Engineering RFQ for Professional Engineering Design

10

BIDS ARE ACCEPTED UNTIL 1:30PM THURSDAY, May 14, 2020.



FORT WORTH

Project:

20-0130: ITB Service Body Trucks

Department: Fleet
Date: 5/14/2020

Company Name: Bid Amount:

1 Grapevine DCJ, LLC ¢ Bid #1 $393,160.00
2 Grapevine DCJ, LLC ¢ Bid #2 $408, 245.00
3 Randall Reed's Prestige Ford ¢ Bid #1 $289,310.00
4 Randall Reed's Prestige Ford ¢ Bid #2 $297,560.00
5 $
6 $
7 $
8 $
9 $

10 $

BIDS ARE ACCEPTED UNTIL 1:30PM THURSDAY, May 14, 2020.

Lakita Slack-Johnson



FORT WORTH

Project:

20-0133: ITB Off Road Equipment

Department: Fleet
Date: 5/14/2020

Company Name: Bid Amount:
1 RDO Equipment ¢ 368,576.81
2 Holt Cat ¢ 386,082.72
24,828.00 Not All Items
3 Landmark Equipment $ Bid On
4 Associated Supply Company $ 354,935.75
5 $
6 $
7 $
8 $
9 $
10 $

BIDS ARE ACCEPTED UNTIL 1:30PM THURSDAY, May 14, 2020.

Lakita Slack-Johnson



1

2

10

FORT WORTH

Project:

102639: 2020 Miscellaneous Ss Manhole Repair Contract

Department:
Date: 5/14/2020

Company Name: Bid Amount:

BCAC Underground, LLC $ 194,250.00

Ace Pipe Cleaning, Inc. $ 187,225.00

$

BIDS ARE ACCEPTED UNTIL 1:30PM THURSDAY, May 14, 2020.

J. Chris Underwood/Lawrence Hamilton
2629/2527



FORT WORTH

Project:

100995: Lake Arlington Lift Station

Department: Water
Date: 5/14/2020

Company Name: Bid Amount:

1 Bar COﬂStI’UCtOI’S, Inc. $ Bid #1 $10,144,701.00 Bid #2 $ 10,077,693.00 Bid #3 No Bid
2 Gracon Construction, Inc. $ #111,829,810.00 #211,763,810.00 #3 No Bid
3 Felix Construction Company $ #1$10.839,571.00 #210,763,221.00 #3 No Bid
4 Cresent Construction, Inc. ¢ #1 10,648,000.00 #210,573,000.00 #3 No Bid
5 $
6 $
7 $
8 $
9 $

10 $

BIDS ARE ACCEPTED UNTIL 1:30PM THURSDAY, May 14, 2020.

Pratima Poudyal



FORT WORTH

Project:

2020 TPW: Request For Qualifications For Professional Engineering Design And Consultant Services, For
Delivery Of Planning, Design, And Construction Of Capital Projects

Department: TPW
Date: 5/14/2020

Company Name: Bid Amount:
1 JT Engineering $
2 HNTB $
3 Pelation Land Solutions $
4 Binkley & Barfield $
5 Jacobs $
6 MMA $
7 Halff Associates $
8 Urban Engineers Group $
9 Civil Associates, Inc. $
10 Bartlett & West $

BIDS ARE ACCEPTED UNTIL 1:30PM THURSDAY, May 14, 2020.

Lauren Prieur



FORT WORTH

Project:

2020 TPW: Request For Qualifications For Professional Engineering Design And Consultant Services, For
Delivery Of Planning, Design, And Construction Of Capital Projects

Department: TPW
Date: 5/14/2020

Company Name: Bid Amount:
1 Alfred Benesch & Company $
2 Wade Trim $
3 Lockwood Andrews & Newman $
4 ANA Consultants $
5 EPB Associates $
6 BGE $
7 Lina T. Ramey & Associates, Inc. $
8 Kimley Horn $
9 EJES, Inc. $
10 Arrendondo, Zepeda & Bruz, LLC. $

BIDS ARE ACCEPTED UNTIL 1:30PM THURSDAY, May 14, 2020.

Lauren Prieur



FORT WORTH

Project:

2020 TPW: Request For Qualifications For Professional Engineering Design And Consultant Services, For
Delivery Of Planning, Design, And Construction Of Capital Projects

Department: TPW
Date: 5/14/2020

Company Name: Bid Amount:
1 Hayden Consultants $
2 Burgess & Niple $
3 Maser Consulting $
4 HDR $
5 IEA, Inc. $
6 Dunaway $
7 Carrillo Engineering, LLC $
8 Transystems $
9 McKissack & McKissack $
10 Wier & Associates, Inc. $

BIDS ARE ACCEPTED UNTIL 1:30PM THURSDAY, May 14, 2020.

Lauren Prieur



FORT WORTH

Project:

2020 TPW: Request For Qualifications For Professional Engineering Design And Consultant Services, For
Delivery Of Planning, Design, And Construction Of Capital Projects

Department: TPW
Date: 5/14/2020

Company Name: Bid Amount:
1 Jones Carter $
2 Consor $
3 Simon Engineering & Consulting, Inc. $
4 Weaver Consulting Group $
5 Stream Water Group, Inc. $
6 Teal Engineering Services, Inc. $
7 Lakes Engineering $
8 Othon $
9 Urban Engineers $
10 Walter P. Moore $

BIDS ARE ACCEPTED UNTIL 1:30PM THURSDAY, May 14, 2020.

Lauren Prieur



FORT WORTH

Project:

2020 TPW: Request For Qualifications For Professional Engineering Design And Consultant Services, For
Delivery Of Planning, Design, And Construction Of Capital Projects

Department: TPW
Date: 5/14/2020

Company Name: Bid Amount:
1 Neal Schaffer $
2 Huitt-Zollars $
3 Deshazo Group, Inc. $
4 RLG Consulting Engineers $
5 WSB $
6 Dannenbaum $
7 Harris Kocher Smith $
8 Westra Consultants $
9 Lee Engineering, LLC $
10 Burns McDonnell $

BIDS ARE ACCEPTED UNTIL 1:30PM THURSDAY, May 14, 2020.

Lauren Prieur



FORT WORTH

Project:

2020 TPW: Request For Qualifications For Professional Engineering Design And Consultant Services, For
Delivery Of Planning, Design, And Construction Of Capital Projects

Department: TPW
Date: 5/14/2020

Company Name: Bid Amount:
1 Shield Engineering Group $
2 MV Engineerng, Inc. $
3 Volk Consulting, Inc. $
4 Pacheco Koch $
5 VRX, Inc. $
6 Stantec $
7 Multatech $
8 Dal-Tech Engineering, Inc. $
9 Criado & Associates $
10 Baird Hampton & Brown $

BIDS ARE ACCEPTED UNTIL 1:30PM THURSDAY, May 14, 2020.

Lauren Prieur



FORT WORTH

Project:

2020 TPW: Request For Qualifications For Professional Engineering Design And Consultant Services, For
Delivery Of Planning, Design, And Construction Of Capital Projects

Department: TPW
Date: 5/14/2020

Company Name: Bid Amount:
1 Freese and Nichols $
2 Lamb Star Engineering, LLC $
3 Visintainer & Engineering, PLLC $
4 Michael Baker International $
5 ARS Engineering $
6 AECOM Technical Services, Inc. $
7 Teague Nall and Perkins, Inc. $
8 Lochner $
9 Steven Eubanks Engineering, LLC $
10 The Rios Group $

BIDS ARE ACCEPTED UNTIL 1:30PM THURSDAY, May 14, 2020.

Lauren Prieur



FORT WORTH

Project:

2020 TPW: Request For Qualifications For Professional Engineering Design And Consultant Services, For
Delivery Of Planning, Design, And Construction Of Capital Projects

Department: TPW
Date: 5/14/2020

Company Name: Bid Amount:
1 Spiars Engineering $
2 Graham Associates, Inc. $
3 Cobb Fendley $
4 LJA Engineering, Inc. $
5 Bridge Farmer & Associates, Inc. $
6 Aguirre & Fields $
7 $
8 $
9 $
10 $

BIDS ARE ACCEPTED UNTIL 1:30PM THURSDAY, May 14, 2020.

Lauren Prieur



Project:

FORT WORTH

102240 Northside 3 Offsite Water Main

Department: Water
Date: 5/14/2020

Company Name:

1 Jackson Consruction

2 Mountain Cascade

3 Conatser Construction, TX, LP

4 McKee Utility Contractor

5 Belt Construction, Inc.

6 Thalle Construction

7 Wilson Contractor Services

8 Garney Companies, Inc.

9 S.J. Louis Construction of TX

10

Bid Amount:

$ 1,711,434.10

$ 10,017,044.22

¢ 10,088, 225.90

$ 11,125,647.00

$ 8,926,313.19

$ 10,945,736.60

$ 10,220,630.32

$ 11,910,099.90

$ 9,735,129.84

BIDS ARE ACCEPTED UNTIL 1:30PM THURSDAY, May 14, 2020.

Eddie Eckart 817-329-4373



